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Fwd: LIC HFL — United Way of Baroda Partnership

2 messages

Mitva Desai <mitva.desai@unitedwayofbaroda.org>

Ritu Kaur <ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org> Fri, Aug 29, 2025 at 3:51 PM
To: Nilam Acharya <nilam.acharya@unitedwayofbaroda.org>, Mitva Desai <mitva.desai@unitedwayofbaroda.org>

Ritu Kaur Atthwal | Assistant Manager - CSR
M- 9898345197
United Way of Baroda

Alembic City Building No. 1965, Alembic Road, Gorwa, Vadodara - 390003
Tel +91 2345144 | 2337715 | 2357716
GIVE. | ADVOCATE. | VOLUNTEER. | LIVE UNITED.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sravanti Eligeti <Sravanti.Eligeti@lichousing.com>

Date: Fri, Aug 29, 2025 at 3:50 PM

Subject: LIC HFL — United Way of Baroda Partnership

To: ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org <ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org>

Cc: anitha kumari <anitha.kumari@lichousing.com>, YASH JAIN <YASH.JAIN@lichousing.com>

Dear Ritu Kaur Atthwal,
Greetings from LIC Housing Finance Limited!

It is our immense pleasure to inform you that the competent authority of LIC HFL has considered the CSR proposal
from United Way of Baroda for the LIC HFL Sanjeevani Project in Panchmahal and Dahod, Gujarat.

After deliberation, CSR Committee accorded a sanction of ¥ 1,25,75,440/- (Rupees One crore twenty-five lakh
seventy-five thousand four hundred forty only), to procure Shishu Kits, Ambulance, and conduct BCC sessions for the
tribal population as per the proposal submitted by you. The implementation is planned from 1/10/2025 to 30/9/2026
benefitting 10000 beneficiaries.

As per the proposal submitted by you, the following guidelines need to be followed:

1. The Project Code for this Project is PC.63.2536. Kindly add reference to the Project Code in all
communications related to the project.

2. Sanctioned amount shall be disbursed as per the agreed tranches mentioned in the proposal.

3. You shall be required to adhere to the LIC HFL CSR Branding Guidelines and send us the branding draft
for approval before implementation.

4. Share the funding request letter for all tranches as per the timelines.

5. We shall require periodic beneficiary reports (beneficiaries, enterprises, the area under organic
cultivation, case studies, etc.), which shall be mutually discussed prior to initiating the project.

6. You must submit the desired financial reports on a defined periodic basis on LIC HFL stipulated template
(Monthly Statement of Expenditure, Quarterly Audited Utilisation Certificate, Quarterly Narrative Report).

7. Subsequent tranche shall only be provided in case of quarterly satisfactory field visits conducted by the
LIC HFL team.

8. Additionally, you are requested to fill in the required details and share the legalized affidavit draft and
vendor registration for review to YASH.JAIN@)Iichousing.com before finalizing and sharing the notarized



https://www.google.com/maps/search/Alembic+Road,+Gorwa,+Vadodara+-+390003?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:Sravanti.Eligeti@lichousing.com
mailto:Sravanti.Eligeti@lichousing.com
mailto:ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org
mailto:ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org
mailto:ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org
mailto:anitha.kumari@lichousing.com
mailto:YASH.JAIN@lichousing.com
mailto:YASH.JAIN@lichousing.com

hardcopy of the affidavit document on 100 Rupees stamp paper on or before 5/9/2025 with the stipulated
attachments/annexures (Project Proposal, Monthly Work Plan, Budgets, KYC Documents of Board members
duly signed and stamped and Reporting Pattern) to the following address:

To,

CSR Department

LIC Housing Finance Ltd.

Corporate Office, 11! Floor,
Maker Tower — F Premises,
Cuffe Parade, Mumbai — 400 005
After this, the disbursal process shall begin, and projects can be initiated across proposed geographies.

For any queries on concerns feel free to reach out to Yash Jain at +91 9137317545 (LIC HFL SPOC for the program)

Level — 1 Mr. Yash Jain CSR Project Lead
Level — 2 Mrs. Anitha Kumari Joint GM (CSR & ESG)
NOTE:

1. LIC Housing Finance Ltd reserves the right to call for any other reports for compliance as may be
required from time to time.

2. The attached affidavit format is a protected document and same is prepared by our legal team, hence
please edit the details in respective spaces and share the same file to review.

3. Branding visibility will be as per the Branding Guidelines shared by LIC Housing Finance Limited. Prior
approval needs to be taken before the branding of LIC HFL is displayed.

Looking forward to having a fruitful partnership to achieve the planned objectives.

Thanks & regards,

Sravanti Eligeti

CSR Department S??i LI c H F L gﬂﬂ‘?ffm

, LIC HOUSING FINANCE LTD Responsibility
Corporate Office

phone: +912222178600 131, Maker Tower-F Premises, 13th Floor,
Cuffe Parade, Mumbai-400 005 Maharashtra

00000

www.lichousing.com/

The information in this electronic message and any attachments to this message are intended for the addressee's exclusive use of the addressee(s) and may
contain confidential or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender at LIC Housing Finance Ltd or
lichousing@lichousing.com immediately and destroy all copies of this message and any attachments. The views expressed in this E-mail

message/Attachments are those of the individual sender.
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6 attachments

@ Final Affidavit Legalized.docx

35K

@ LIC HFL Vendor Registration FY24-25.xIsx
29K

k| Self Declaration - Non-Blacklisting.docx
77K

.E Bank Declaration - Data Protected.pdf
419K

@ Special Bank Account Declaration Format.docx
14K

D LIC HFL CSR Brand Guidelines & Logo.rar
9873K

Ritu Kaur <ritukaur@unitedwayofbaroda.org> Sat, Aug 30, 2025 at 6:41 PM

To: Sravanti Eligeti <Sravanti.Eligeti@lichousing.com>
Cc: anitha kumari <anitha.kumari@lichousing.com>, YASH JAIN <YASH.JAIN@Ilichousing.com>, Nilam Acharya
<nilam.acharya@unitedwayofbaroda.org>, Mitva Desai <mitva.desai@unitedwayofbaroda.org>

Dear Sir/Madam,
Greetings from United Way of Baroda !

We sincerely express heartfelt gratitude to LIC Housing Finance Limited
for considering and approving our CSR proposal under the LIC HFL
Sanjeevani Project in Panchmahal and Dahod. We are grateful for the
sanction of ?1,25,75,440/- towards procurement of Shishu Kits,
Ambulance, and BCC sessions, which will positively impact the tribal
communities and benefit 10,000 beneficiaries.

We acknowledge the project code PC.63.2536 and confirm that the same
shall be referenced in all communications related to the project. We also
assure you of complete compliance with the stipulated guidelines,
including branding approvals, periodic reporting, tranche-wise funding
requests, and submission of requisite documents.

As advised, we will share the legalized affidavit draft, vendor registration
details, and supporting documents for review within the stipulated
timeline. Our team will ensure timely submissions and proactive
coordination with you for smooth implementation of the project.

Together with LIC Housing Finance Limited, we look forward to making the
Sanjeevani Project a benchmark initiative in improving lives and building
resilient communities.

Ritu Kaur Atthwal | Assistant Manager - CSR
M- 9898345197
United Way of Baroda

Alembic City Building No. 1965, Alembic Road, Gorwa, Vadodara - 390003
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